
ITEM # PROPERTY OWNER 1 2

Debbie Agee

5417 Robin Circle

Adamsville, AL 35005

(205) 905-0172

Case # 22-15-3

S&W CONSTRUCTION LLC UNCH INC.

WORK WRITEUP

Side Porch Repairs 1,450.00$                                                  6,960.00$         

Kitchen Repairs 7,500.00$                                                  2,900.00$         

Foundation Ventilation 2,500.00$                                                  2,200.00$         

Hallway Bathroom Repairs 4,500.00$                                                  3,960.00$         

Rear Bathroom Repairs 15,200.00$                                                17,000.00$       

Safety 500.00$                                                     850.00$             

PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #1 31,650.00$                                         33,870.00$     

BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #1 31,650.00$                                         33,870.00$     

Mary Evans

518 Inglenook Drive

Hueytown, AL 35023

(205) 690-1250

Case # 22-18-3

S&W CONSTRUCTION LLC UNCH INC.

WORK WRITEUP

Rear Deck Replacement 10,600.00$                                                10,975.00$       

Door Replacement 900.00$                                                     1,175.00$         

Kitchen Repairs 2,200.00$                                                  4,975.00$         

Rear Bathroom Repairs 11,800.00$                                                14,900.00$       

Bathroom Repairs 500.00$                                                     650.00$             

PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #2 26,000.00$                                         32,675.00$     

BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #2 26,000.00$                                         32,675.00$     

BID TABULATION - BID SUBMISSION

ITB 1-24 "Housing Rehabilitation Services"

Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer

Email:  underwoodf@jccal.org

Phone:  205-714-3747

1

2

Page 1 of 3



ITEM # PROPERTY OWNER 1 2

James Jackson

5700 10th Street South

Lipscomb, AL 35020

(205) 830-9051

Case: 23-JJ-2

S&W CONSTRUCTION LLC UNCH INC.

WORK WRITEUP NO BID
Kitchen Repairs -$                                                           16,850.00$       

Living Room Repairs -$                                                           2,980.00$         

Exterior Repairs -$                                                           2,740.00$         

PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #3 -$                                                    22,570.00$     

BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #3 -$                                                    22,570.00$     

Terry Amison

35 6th Street N.E.

Graysville, AL 35073

(205) 760-4997

Case: 22-2-3

S&W CONSTRUCTION LLC UNCH INC.

WORK WRITEUP NO BID
Foundation Repairs 12,000.00$                                                -$                  

Vinyl Siding Repairs 10,200.00$                                                -$                  

Kitchen Repairs 11,900.00$                                                -$                  

Living Room Repairs 3,200.00$                                                  -$                  

Safety 2,200.00$                                                  -$                  

PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #4 39,500.00$                                         -$                

BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #4 39,500.00$                                         -$                

Edgar Washington

4616 Robin Ave.

Adamsville, AL 35005

(205) 774-7408

Case # 22-WE-3

S&W CONSTRUCTION LLC UNCH INC.

WORK WRITEUP NO BID
Exterior Repairs -$                                                           14,840.00$       

Door Replacement -$                                                           2,975.00$         

Kitchen Repairs -$                                                           7,600.00$         

Ceiling Repairs -$                                                           4,500.00$         

Front Entrance Modifications -$                                                           2,975.00$         

Rear Entrance Modifications -$                                                           1,040.00$         

Safety -$                                                           850.00$             

PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #5 -$                                                    34,780.00$     

BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #5 -$                                                    34,780.00$     
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ITEM # PROPERTY OWNER 1 2

Joyce Willis

2012 4th Street NE

Centerpoint, AL 35215

(205) 492-8664

Case # 23-15-4

S&W CONSTRUCTION LLC UNCH INC.

WORK WRITEUP NO BID
Exterior Porch Repairs -$                                                           10,400.00$       

Front Bedroom -$                                                           1,160.00$         

Bedroom Repairs -$                                                           16,600.00$       

Miscellaneous -$                                                           4,200.00$         

Safety -$                                                           850.00$             

PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #6 -$                                                    33,210.00$     

BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #6 -$                                                    -$                

PURCHASING'S TOTAL BID AMOUNT FOR ITEM's 1-6 97,150.00$                                         157,105.00$   

BIDDER'S TOTAL BID AMOUNT FOR ITEM's 1-6 97,150.00$                                         157,105.00$   

S&W CONSTRUCTION LLC UNCH INC.
Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

S&W 

CONSTRUCTION 

LLC

UNCH INC.

150 Tyler Road, Remlap, Alabama 35133 | Contact: Shane Shirley, Owner | Phone: 205-568-0879 |  Email: shanedshirley4@gmail.com

524 4th Avenue North, Birmingham, Alabama 35204 | Contact: Michael Raby, President | Phone: 205-581-1688 or 205-281-4349 | Fax: 205-581-

1687 |  Email: unch524@gmail.com
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CONTACT INFORMATION

REQUIRED FORMS 
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Non-Collustion Affidavit

Affidavit of Contractor

GRAND TOTAL 

FOR ALL ITEMS

Bid Form

Notification of Intent to Respond

Jefferson County, AL Equal Employment Opportunity Certification Form

Debarment Statement
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